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APPLICATION FOR MEMBERSHIP TO THE COARSE SECTION 
 

Name:  ………………………………………………………………………………… Date of Birth: …………………………. 
 
Address: ………………………………………………………………………………………………………………………………… 
 
………………………………………………………………………………………….. Postcode: …………………………………. 
 
Telephone: ………………………………………. Email: ………………………………………………………………………… 
 
Current Employment: ………………………………………………………………………………….…… Age: ………….. 
 
Current Angling Club Memberships (including Angling Trust, PAC, etc.): ……………………………….. 
 
………………………………………………………………………………………………………………………………………………. 
 
Current EA Rod Licence No.: ……………………………………………. Issue Date: ………………………………… 
 
Proposer (SPS member’s name/membership no.): ………………………………………………………………… 
 
Number of years applicant known to proposer: ……………………………………………………………………. 
 
We prefer any proposer to be a Society member of at least two years’ standing and to be well 
acquainted with the applicant, also for a minimum of two years. The Proposer must write a 
letter detailing their knowledge and recommendation of the applicant to the Society’s Coarse 
Membership Secretary. This may be included with the application, posted separately or 
emailed to coarsemsec@spsfishing.co.uk.  
 
I agree to the Sussex Piscatorial Society Ltd and its officers holding the information 
provided by me and any related correspondence for a period of time reasonable to process 
my application or for the duration of my membership if I am accepted. Please refer to the 
SPS Data Protection Policy at https://spsfishing.co.uk/data-protection-policy/ Your 
membership details will not be shared with any other organisation. 
 
 
APPLICANT’S SIGNATURE: ……………………………………………………………………………………………………… 
 
I, the above signed applicant (and such of my family who may become associate 
members), agree to abide by the code of conduct, rules and regulations of the Society and 
understand that non-compliance renders a member liable to expulsion. I give my permission 
for the Society to take up any references with regard to my angling they feel necessary. 
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ADDITIONAL INFORMATION REQUIRED (to be enclosed with application) 
 
A recent passport-sized (45 x 35mm) photograph of the applicant. 
 
A detailed overview of the applicant’s angling history (minimum 200 words). 
 
 
If requested, are you willing to attend at least one working party each season? YES / NO*  
 
(If no, please state reason): …………………………….…………………………………………………………………… 
 
…………………………………………………………………………………………………………………………………………….. 
                                                                                                                              *Delete as applicable 
 
All applications received, either proposed or non-proposed will be placed on the current 
waiting list. When vacancies arise applicants will be called to attend an informal interview. 
Following this, if your application is successful, membership is on a two-year probationary 
period; thereafter, members are invited to renew on an annual basis. 
 
New members will be required to pay three full years’ membership fees before any Senior 
discounts become available. 
 
A key deposit will be added to the first year’s membership fee. This will be returned (minus a 
small administration fee) should membership cease, subject to the return of the key. 
 
Please check that all information requested above is complete and correct and return the 
completed application form, accompanied by a passport-sized photograph, angling history 
overview and proposer recommendation (if available) to: 
 
Mr Keith Russell 
SPS Coarse Membership Secretary 
45 Lark Hill 
Hove 
Sussex BN3 8PF 
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